
12-10-0905 Original Bid Listing

Continue to bid award | Specification Review

Dealer Western Northern Central Southern 

#1. 1 TON CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2

Ford F-350 (F3G)

Alan Jay Ford Lincoln $20,463.00 $20,213.00 $20,163.00 $20,188.00

Bartow Ford $20,494.00 $20,494.00 $20,494.00 $20,494.00

Don Reid Ford, Inc. $21,099.00 $20,899.00 $20,499.00 $20,699.00

Duval Ford $20,117.00 $20,117.00 $20,117.00 $20,117.00

Mullinax Ford of Osceola County $20,794.00 $20,794.00 $20,794.00 $20,794.00

Rountree-Moore Ford, LLLP $21,539.00 $21,266.00 $21,406.00 $21,536.00

Hub City Ford, Inc. $21,249.00 $21,249.00 $21,249.00 $21,249.00

Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD (CC31003)

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $20,543.00 $20,493.00 $20,193.00 $20,418.00

Dale Earnhardt Jr. Chevrolet $21,359.00 $21,399.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Maroone Chevrolet, LLC -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $21,121.00

Rountree-Moore Chevrolet $21,096.00 $20,777.00 $20,977.00 $21,097.00

Stingray Chevrolet $20,294.00 $19,944.00 $19,944.00 $19,944.00

GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TC31003)

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $20,842.00 $20,793.00 $20,492.00 $20,717.00

Dale Earnhardt Jr. Buick-GMC-Cadillac $21,359.00 $21,399.00 $21,471.00 -- No bid --

Dodge Ram 3500 (DD3L63)

Beck Auto Sales, Inc. $23,378.00 $23,328.00 $23,353.00 $23,378.00

Maroone Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram $21,799.00 $21,799.00 $21,799.00 $21,799.00

Orange Park Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram $21,788.00 $21,788.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Freightliner Sprinter (F3CC144)

Atlantic Truck Center $29,493.00 $29,493.00 $29,493.00 $29,493.00

Orlando Freightliner $31,689.00 $31,689.00 $31,689.00 $31,689.00

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $33,217.00 $33,217.00 $33,217.00 $33,217.00

#2. 1 TON CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x4

Ford F-350 (F3H)

Alan Jay Ford Lincoln $23,215.00 $23,165.00 $22,988.00 $22,988.00

Bartow Ford $23,294.00 $23,294.00 $23,294.00 $23,294.00

Don Reid Ford, Inc. $23,810.00 $23,510.00 $23,010.00 $23,310.00

Duval Ford $22,934.00 $22,934.00 $22,934.00 $22,934.00

Mullinax Ford of Osceola County $23,597.00 $23,597.00 $23,597.00 $23,597.00
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Rountree-Moore Ford, LLLP $24,564.00 $24,244.00 $24,394.00 $24,544.00

Hub City Ford, Inc. $23,099.00 $23,099.00 $23,099.00 $23,099.00

Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD (CK31003)

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $23,562.00 $23,522.00 $23,222.00 $23,447.00

Dale Earnhardt Jr. Chevrolet $24,537.00 $24,587.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Maroone Chevrolet, LLC -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $24,414.00

Rountree-Moore Chevrolet $24,196.00 $23,946.00 $24,086.00 $24,196.00

Stingray Chevrolet $23,497.00 $23,152.00 $23,152.00 $23,162.00

GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TK31003)

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $23,912.00 $23,872.00 $23,572.00 $23,797.00

Dale Earnhardt Jr. Buick-GMC-Cadillac $24,537.00 $24,587.00 $24,636.00 -- No bid --

Dodge Ram 3500 (DD8L63)

Beck Auto Sales, Inc. $24,183.00 $24,108.00 $24,133.00 $24,183.00

Maroone Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram $22,469.00 $22,469.00 $22,469.00 $22,469.00

Orange Park Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram $22,854.00 $22,854.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#3. TILT CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2

Isuzu NF154

Deland Truck Center, Inc. $37,607.00 $37,607.00 $37,607.00 $37,607.00

Isuzu Truck of Ocala $37,383.00 $37,383.00 $37,383.00 $37,383.00

Rush Enterprises $37,673.00 $37,673.00 $37,673.00 -- No bid --

TruckMax, Inc. $37,869.00 $37,869.00 $37,869.00 $37,869.00

Mitsubishi FE125

TruckMax, Inc. $35,998.00 $35,998.00 $35,998.00 $35,998.00

#4. 15,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2

Ford F-450 (F4G)

Alan Jay Ford Lincoln $31,669.00 $31,519.00 $31,469.00 $31,494.00

Bartow Ford $31,378.00 $31,378.00 $31,378.00 $31,378.00

Duval Ford $31,356.00 $31,356.00 $31,356.00 $31,356.00

Mullinax Ford of Osceola County $32,101.00 $32,101.00 $32,101.00 $32,101.00

Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. $32,949.00 $32,849.00 $31,999.00 $31,999.00

Rountree-Moore Ford, LLLP $32,998.00 $32,716.00 $32,886.00 $32,996.00

Hub City Ford, Inc. $32,599.00 $32,599.00 $32,599.00 $32,599.00

Dodge Ram 4500 (DP4L63)

Beck Auto Sales, Inc. $37,827.00 $37,752.00 $37,777.00 $37,827.00

Maroone Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram $36,989.00 $36,989.00 $36,989.00 $36,989.00

Orange Park Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram $35,847.00 $35,847.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

International Terrastar
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Navistar, Inc. $42,115.00 $42,115.00 $42,115.00 $42,115.00

#5. 15,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x4

Ford F-450 (F4H)

Alan Jay Ford Lincoln $34,527.00 $34,427.00 $34,277.00 $34,277.00

Bartow Ford $34,178.00 $34,178.00 $34,178.00 $34,178.00

Duval Ford $34,181.00 $34,181.00 $34,181.00 $34,181.00

Mullinax Ford of Osceola County $34,911.00 $34,911.00 $34,911.00 $34,911.00

Rountree-Moore Ford, LLLP $35,860.00 $35,540.00 $35,690.00 $35,840.00

Hub City Ford, Inc. $35,399.00 $35,399.00 $35,399.00 $35,399.00

Dodge Ram 4500 (DP9L63)

Beck Auto Sales, Inc. $39,604.00 $39,529.00 $39,554.00 $39,604.00

Maroone Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram $37,839.00 $37,839.00 $37,839.00 $37,839.00

Orange Park Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram $37,797.00 $37,797.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#6. 17,501 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2

Ford F-550 (F5G)

Alan Jay Ford Lincoln $32,684.00 $32,584.00 $32,434.00 $32,434.00

Bartow Ford $32,342.00 $32,342.00 $32,342.00 $32,342.00

Duval Ford $32,318.00 $32,318.00 $32,318.00 $32,318.00

Mullinax Ford of Osceola County $33,056.00 $33,056.00 $33,056.00 $33,056.00

Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. $32,452.00 $32,452.00 $31,699.00 $31,699.00

Rountree-Moore Ford, LLLP $33,988.00 $33,678.00 $33,828.00 $33,978.00

Hub City Ford, Inc. $35,499.00 $35,499.00 $35,499.00 $35,499.00

Dodge Ram 5500 (DP5L63)

Beck Auto Sales, Inc. $38,504.00 $38,429.00 $38,454.00 $38,504.00

Maroone Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram $36,949.00 $36,949.00 $36,949.00 $36,949.00

Orange Park Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram $36,942.00 $36,942.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Freightliner M2

Orlando Freightliner $45,503.00 $45,503.00 $45,503.00 $45,503.00

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $51,548.00 $51,548.00 $51,548.00 $51,548.00

International Terrastar

Navistar, Inc. $42,338.00 $42,338.00 $42,338.00 $42,338.00

Kenworth T170

Kenworth of Central Florida $69,155.00 -- No bid -- $68,451.00 -- No bid --

Kenworth of Jacksonville $67,547.00 $66,977.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Peterbilt 325

Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $61,356.00

Rush Enterprises $63,706.00 $63,706.00 $63,706.00 -- No bid --
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#7. 17,501 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x4

Ford F-550 (F5H)

Alan Jay Ford Lincoln $35,493.00 $35,393.00 $35,243.00 $35,243.00

Bartow Ford $35,143.00 $35,143.00 $35,143.00 $35,143.00

Duval Ford $35,143.00 $35,143.00 $35,143.00 $35,143.00

Mullinax Ford of Osceola County $35,867.00 $35,867.00 $35,867.00 $35,867.00

Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. $35,999.00 $35,999.00 $35,254.00 $35,199.00

Rountree-Moore Ford, LLLP $36,819.00 $36,498.00 $36,653.00 $38,798.00

Hub City Ford, Inc. $36,499.00 $36,499.00 $36,499.00 $36,499.00

Dodge Ram 5500 (DP0L63)

Beck Auto Sales, Inc. $41,358.00 $41,283.00 $41,308.00 $41,358.00

Maroone Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram $39,799.00 $39,799.00 $39,799.00 $39,799.00

Orange Park Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram $39,739.00 $39,739.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#8. 25,500 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2

Ford F-650 (F6F)

Bartow Ford $43,789.00 $43,789.00 $43,789.00 $43,789.00

Duval Ford $46,996.00 $46,600.00 $46,996.00 $46,996.00

Mike Davidson Ford $45,264.00 $45,264.00 $45,264.00 $45,264.00

Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. $46,297.00 $46,297.00 $45,297.00 $44,997.00

Hub City Ford, Inc. $46,999.00 $46,999.00 $46,999.00 $46,999.00

Freightliner M2

Atlantic Truck Center $47,992.00 $47,992.00 $47,992.00 $47,992.00

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $53,250.00 $53,250.00 $53,250.00 $53,250.00

Hino 268A

Capital Truck, Inc. $58,550.00 $58,850.00 $59,250.00 $59,450.00

Rush Enterprises $62,222.00 $62,222.00 $62,222.00 -- No bid --

TruckMax, Inc. $57,808.00 $57,808.00 $57,808.00 $57,808.00

International Durastar

Navistar, Inc. $56,022.00 $56,022.00 $56,022.00 $56,022.00

Kenworth T270

Kenworth of Central Florida $70,389.00 -- No bid -- $69,685.00 -- No bid --

Kenworth of Jacksonville $69,541.00 $68,970.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kenworth of South Florida -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $68,391.00

Peterbilt 330

Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $64,001.00

Rush Enterprises $66,310.00 $66,310.00 $66,310.00 -- No bid --

#9. 30,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2
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Ford F-750 (F7F)

Bartow Ford $44,678.00 $44,678.00 $44,678.00 $44,678.00

Duval Ford $48,029.00 $47,829.00 $48,029.00 $48,229.00

Mike Davidson Ford $43,461.00 $43,461.00 $43,461.00 $43,461.00

Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. $46,558.00 $46,558.00 $45,558.00 $45,329.00

Hub City Ford, Inc. $47,099.00 $47,099.00 $47,099.00 $47,099.00

Freightliner M2

Atlantic Truck Center $37,945.00 $37,945.00 $37,945.00 $37,945.00

Orlando Freightliner $43,420.00 $43,420.00 $43,420.00 $43,420.00

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $46,548.00 $46,548.00 $46,548.00 $46,548.00

Hino 338

Capital Truck, Inc. $60,995.00 $61,250.00 $61,450.00 $61,450.00

Rush Enterprises $64,258.00 $64,258.00 $64,258.00 -- No bid --

TruckMax, Inc. $59,504.00 $59,504.00 $59,504.00 $59,504.00

International Durastar

Navistar, Inc. $56,802.00 $56,802.00 $56,802.00 $56,802.00

Kenworth T370

Kenworth of Central Florida $70,501.00 -- No bid -- $69,772.00 -- No bid --

Kenworth of Jacksonville $69,177.00 $68,607.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kenworth of South Florida -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $69,915.00

Peterbilt 337

Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $65,722.00

Rush Enterprises $68,878.00 $68,878.00 $68,878.00 -- No bid --

Western Star 4700

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $76,906.00 $76,906.00 $76,906.00 $76,906.00

#10. 52,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4x6 TANDEM AXLE TRACTOR (Only)

American LaFrance Condor

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $140,539.00 $140,539.00 $140,539.00 $140,539.00

Caterpillar CT660

Pantropic Power -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $101,800.00

Ring Power Corporation $101,792.00 $101,792.00 $101,792.00 -- No bid --

Freightliner M2-112

Atlantic Truck Center $72,905.00 $72,905.00 $72,905.00 $72,905.00

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $80,676.00 $80,676.00 $80,676.00 $80,676.00

International Workstar

Navistar, Inc. $89,636.00 $89,636.00 $89,636.00 $89,636.00

Kenworth T800
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Kenworth of Central Florida $100,684.00 -- No bid -- $99,980.00 -- No bid --

Kenworth of Jacksonville $98,478.00 $97,908.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kenworth of South Florida -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $97,771.00

Mack C or G Series

Capital Truck, Inc. $96,295.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Nextran Truck Center - Lake City -- No bid -- $91,370.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Nextran Truck Center - Miami -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $90,370.00

Nextran Truck Center - Tampa -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $90,370.00 -- No bid --

Peterbilt 367

Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $103,753.00

Rush Enterprises $105,033.00 $105,033.00 $105,033.00 -- No bid --

Volvo V Series

General GMC Truck Sales & Service, Inc. $89,958.00 $89,458.00 $89,458.00 $89,208.00

Nextran Truck Center - Lake City $89,946.00 $89,746.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Nextran Truck Center - Orlando $89,946.00 $89,746.00 $89,746.00 $89,746.00

Nextran Truck Center - Tampa $89,947.00 $89,756.00 $89,746.00 $89,746.00

TruckMax, Inc. $88,358.00 $88,358.00 $88,358.00 $88,358.00

Western Star 4800

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $93,245.00 $93,245.00 $93,245.00 $93,245.00

#11. 52,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4x6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK

American LaFrance Condor

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $138,787.00 $138,787.00 $138,787.00 $138,787.00

Caterpillar CT660

Pantropic Power -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $99,700.00

Ring Power Corporation $99,705.00 $99,705.00 $99,705.00 -- No bid --

Freightliner M2-112

Atlantic Truck Center $58,888.00 $58,888.00 $58,888.00 $58,888.00

Orlando Freightliner $66,295.00 $66,295.00 $66,295.00 $66,295.00

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $74,392.00 $74,392.00 $74,392.00 $74,392.00

International Workstar

Navistar, Inc. $89,415.00 $89,415.00 $89,415.00 $89,415.00

Kenworth T800

Kenworth of Central Florida $99,976.00 -- No bid -- $99,276.00 -- No bid --

Kenworth of Jacksonville $98,687.86 $98,109.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kenworth of South Florida -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $94,997.00

Mack C or G Series

Capital Truck, Inc. $105,396.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --
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Nextran Truck Center - Lake City -- No bid -- $99,127.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Nextran Truck Center - Miami -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $99,127.00

Nextran Truck Center - Tampa -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $99,127.00 -- No bid --

Peterbilt 367

Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $101,412.00

Rush Enterprises $106,461.00 $106,461.00 $106,461.00 -- No bid --

Volvo V Series

General GMC Truck Sales & Service, Inc. $88,666.00 $88,466.00 $88,466.00 $87,666.00

Nextran Truck Center - Lake City $90,310.00 $90,110.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Nextran Truck Center - Orlando $90,310.00 $90,110.00 $90,110.00 $90,110.00

Nextran Truck Center - Tampa $90,310.00 $90,110.00 $90,110.00 $90,110.00

TruckMax, Inc. $88,215.00 $88,215.00 $88,215.00 $88,215.00

Western Star 4700

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $87,440.00 $87,440.00 $87,440.00 $87,440.00

#12. 60,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4x6 TANDEM AXLE REFUSE TRUCK (Only)

American LaFrance Condor

Tampa Truck Center, LLC $149,425.00 $149,425.00 $149,425.00 $149,425.00

Autocar ACX64

General GMC Truck Sales & Service, Inc. $144,554.00 $143,995.00 -- No bid -- $142,995.00

Kenworth of Central Florida $151,200.00 $150,898.00 $150,446.00 -- No bid --

Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. $143,754.00 $142,780.00 $140,499.00 $138,468.00

Crane Carrier LET2

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. $169,900.00 $169,900.00 $169,900.00 $169,900.00

Mack MR Series

Capital Truck, Inc. $131,019.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Nextran Truck Center - Lake City -- No bid -- $126,927.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Nextran Truck Center - Miami -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $126,927.00

Nextran Truck Center - Tampa -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $126,927.00 -- No bid --

Peterbilt 320

Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $127,273.00

Rush Enterprises $133,609.00 $133,609.00 $133,609.00 -- No bid --

#13. 15 ft. FLEX WING ROTARY MOWER - PTO DRIVEN

Alamo Eagle 15

Alamo Sales Corp. $15,052.00 $15,052.00 $15,052.00 $15,052.00

Bush Hog 3815

Construction Sales & Service, Inc. $15,368.00 $15,568.00 $15,768.00 $15,968.00

Creel Tractor Company $16,110.00 $15,810.00 $15,580.00 $15,075.00
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Everglades Farm Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $15,095.00 $15,895.00

Greensouth Equipment, Inc. $14,850.00 $15,200.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kingline Equipment $15,450.00 $15,650.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Robinson Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- $15,290.00 $15,290.00 -- No bid --

Diamond (DFW180C)

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $24,470.00 $24,470.00

Landpride Batwing (RC5515)

Creel Tractor Company $16,110.00 $15,880.00 $15,680.00 $15,310.00

Futch's Tractor Depot, Inc. $14,000.00 $13,400.00 $13,400.00 $14,000.00

Gulf Coast Tractor & Equipment $14,988.00 $14,488.00 $13,988.00 $14,488.00

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $15,985.00

Ring Power Corporation $16,963.00 $16,963.00 $16,963.00 -- No bid --

Rhino FR180

Construction Sales & Service, Inc. $15,917.00 $16,017.00 $16,117.00 $16,217.00

Everglades Farm Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $14,450.00 $14,450.00

Glade & Grove Supply Co., Inc. $15,230.00 $15,030.00 $14,680.00 $14,680.00

Triple D Equipment, Inc. $16,072.00 $15,472.00 $15,472.00 $15,772.00

Schulte FX-1800

Everglades Farm Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $16,394.00 $16,394.00

Glade & Grove Supply Co., Inc. $17,308.00 $17,108.00 $16,758.00 $16,758.00

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $16,160.00

Woods BW180HD

Kingline Equipment $14,450.00 $15,200.00 $15,500.00 $15,900.00

#14. ZERO TURN RADIUS COMMERCIAL GRADE MOWER

Bad Boy Outlaw 6100

Creel Tractor Company $6,980.00 $6,880.00 $6,774.00 $6,374.00

Bush Hog EC2661

Creel Tractor Company $7,888.00 $7,688.00 $7,288.00 $6,980.00

eXmark Lazer Z S-Series

Greensouth Equipment, Inc. $9,600.00 $9,600.00 $9,600.00 $9,700.00

Hustler X One

Greensouth Equipment, Inc. $7,400.00 $7,500.00 $7,400.00 $7,600.00

John Deere Z920

Everglades Farm Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $8,850.00 $8,850.00

Greensouth Equipment, Inc. $8,800.00 $8,900.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kubota ZG327P-60

Creel Tractor Company $9,490.00 $9,300.00 $9,240.00 $8,788.00
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Futch's Tractor Depot, Inc. $8,000.00 $7,850.00 $7,850.00 $8,000.00

Gulf Coast Tractor & Equipment $9,188.00 $8,988.00 $8,788.00 $8,888.00

Robinson Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- $8,279.00 $8,279.00 -- No bid --

Triple D Equipment, Inc. $9,007.00 $8,407.00 $8,407.00 $8,707.00

Scag Wildcat

Greensouth Equipment, Inc. $9,650.00 $9,750.00 $9,650.00 $9,850.00

Tiger TG3061

Nortrax, Inc. $11,900.00 $11,800.00 $11,600.00 $11,600.00

Toro 74925

Kingline Equipment $8,650.00 $8,750.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Wesco Turf, Inc. $9,160.00 $9,160.00 $9,160.00 $9,160.00

#15. 12.5 DECK, LARGE DIESEL RIDE-ON INDUSTRIAL WIDE AREA MOWER

MowerMax 75-12.5 Wide Area

ATMAX Equipment Company $62,500.00 $62,500.00 $62,500.00 $62,500.00

#16. SMALL AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR (4 Wheel Drive)

Bobcat CT440

Bobcat/Doosan Company $19,056.00 $19,056.00 $19,056.00 $19,056.00

Case IH Farmall 45A

Glade & Grove Supply Co., Inc. $17,835.00 $17,635.00 $17,285.00 $17,285.00

John Deere 4105

Everglades Farm Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $18,600.00 $18,600.00

Greensouth Equipment, Inc. $20,000.00 $19,600.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kubota L3800

Creel Tractor Company $14,288.00 $14,188.00 $13,988.00 $13,378.00

Futch's Tractor Depot, Inc. $12,750.00 $12,450.00 $12,450.00 $12,750.00

Gulf Coast Tractor & Equipment $14,688.00 $13,988.00 $13,688.00 $13,988.00

Robinson Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- $12,699.00 $12,699.00 -- No bid --

Triple D Equipment, Inc. $13,700.00 $13,100.00 $13,100.00 $13,400.00

LS G3038HL

Construction Sales & Service, Inc. $14,681.00 $14,881.00 $15,081.00 $15,281.00

Mahindra 3616

Creel Tractor Company $14,288.00 $14,088.00 $13,588.00 $13,388.00

Kingline Equipment $14,300.00 $14,800.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Massey Ferguson 1643

Construction Sales & Service, Inc. $18,852.00 $18,952.00 $19,352.00 $19,752.00

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $19,895.00 $19,895.00

New Holland Boomer 35
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Creel Tractor Company $15,688.00 $15,488.00 $15,088.00 $14,588.00

Kingline Equipment $14,300.00 $14,800.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#17. AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR (2 Wheel Drive)

Case IH Farmall 95

Glade & Grove Supply Co., Inc. $25,140.00 $24,940.00 $24,590.00 $24,590.00

Challenger MT455

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $46,000.00

Ring Power Corporation $46,009.00 $46,009.00 $46,009.00 -- No bid --

John Deere 5100

Everglades Farm Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $35,450.00 $35,450.00

Greensouth Equipment, Inc. $38,000.00 $37,500.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kubota M8560

Creel Tractor Company $26,588.00 $26,488.00 $26,115.00 $25,688.00

Futch's Tractor Depot, Inc. $24,492.00 $24,192.00 $24,192.00 $24,492.00

Gulf Coast Tractor & Equipment $27,488.00 $26,988.00 $26,688.00 $26,788.00

Robinson Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- $25,353.00 $25,353.00 -- No bid --

Triple D Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $25,687.00 $25,687.00 $25,987.00

LS P7030C

Construction Sales & Service, Inc. $34,710.00 $34,810.00 $34,910.00 $35,010.00

Mahindra 8560

Kingline Equipment $23,525.00 $23,525.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Massey Ferguson 2670HD

Construction Sales & Service, Inc. $29,271.00 $29,371.00 $29,471.00 $29,571.00

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $29,535.00

Ring Power Corporation $34,201.00 $34,201.00 $34,201.00 -- No bid --

Robinson Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- $28,022.00 $28,022.00 -- No bid --

McCormick T-MAX 100

Trekker Tractor, LLC $28,799.00 $28,799.00 $28,799.00 $28,799.00

New Holland T4050

Creel Tractor Company $34,590.00 $34,390.00 $33,890.00 $33,390.00

Kingline Equipment $34,750.00 $34,750.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#18. AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR WITH BOOM MOWER (4 Wheel Drive)

Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim Boom Mower

Glade & Grove Supply Co., Inc. $94,350.00 $94,150.00 $93,800.00 $93,800.00

Challenger MT465 with Diamond Boom Mower

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $112,000.00

Ring Power Corporation $112,004.00 $112,004.00 $112,004.00 -- No bid --
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John Deere 6430 with Alamo Versa Boom Mower

Alamo Sales Corp. $83,830.00 $83,830.00 $83,830.00 $83,830.00

John Deere 6430 with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower

Nortrax, Inc. $101,904.00 $101,904.00 $101,204.00 $101,204.00

Kubota M108 with Terrain King Boom Mower

Creel Tractor Company $86,725.00 $86,525.00 $86,425.00 $86,225.00

Terrain King Corp. $85,221.00 $85,221.00 $85,221.00 $85,221.00

Massey Ferguson 5460 with Diamond Boom Mower

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $104,682.00 $104,682.00

New Holland TS6.120 with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower

Kingline Equipment $91,500.00 $92,000.00 $92,500.00 $93,500.00

#19. HYDRAULIC MINI EXCAVATOR

Bobcat E26

Bobcat/Doosan Company $26,310.00 $26,310.00 $26,310.00 $26,310.00

Case CX31B

Trekker Tractor, LLC $32,647.00 $32,647.00 $32,647.00 $32,647.00

Caterpillar 303.5

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $36,270.00

Ring Power Corporation $36,267.00 $36,267.00 $36,267.00 -- No bid --

Hitachi ZX27U3

Nortrax, Inc. $27,506.00 $27,506.00 $27,506.00 $27,506.00

JCB 8030Z

Glade & Grove Supply Co., Inc. $28,650.00 $28,450.00 $28,100.00 $28,100.00

John Deere 27D

Everglades Farm Equipment Co., Inc. $26,243.00 $26,243.00 $26,243.00 $26,243.00

Nortrax, Inc. $27,006.00 $27,006.00 $27,006.00 $27,006.00

Kobelco 35SR

Cowin Equipment Company, Inc. $38,583.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $37,556.71 $37,556.71 $37,556.71

Kubota KX 71-3

Creel Tractor Company $29,640.00 $29,540.00 $29,240.00 $28,440.00

Futch's Tractor Depot, Inc. $27,450.00 $26,950.00 $26,950.00 $27,450.00

Gulf Coast Tractor & Equipment $31,988.00 $31,488.00 $30,988.00 $31,488.00

Robinson Equipment Co., Inc. -- No bid -- $27,930.00 $27,930.00 -- No bid --

Triple D Equipment, Inc. $29,174.00 $28,574.00 $28,574.00 $28,874.00

New Holland E35B

Capital Truck, Inc. $34,954.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --
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Kingline Equipment $34,380.00 $34,380.00 $35,250.00 $35,750.00

Takeuchi TB228

Cowin Equipment Company, Inc. $33,249.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $33,084.00 $33,084.00 $33,084.00

Volvo ECR38

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $39,907.00 $39,907.00 $39,907.00 $39,907.00

#20. HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR, WHEELED TYPE - 42,000 lb. OPERATING WEIGHT

Caterpillar M316

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $173,672.00

Ring Power Corporation $170,779.00 $170,779.00 $170,779.00 -- No bid --

Doosan DX210W

Bobcat/Doosan Company $162,376.00 $162,376.00 $162,376.00 $162,376.00

John Deere 190DW

Nortrax, Inc. $158,764.00 $158,764.00 $158,764.00 $158,764.00

Volvo EW180D

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $174,577.00 $174,577.00 $174,577.00 $174,577.00

#21. HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR - 54,000 lb. OPERATING WEIGHT

Case CX250C

Trekker Tractor, LLC $177,000.00 $177,000.00 $177,000.00 $177,000.00

Caterpillar 324

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $195,200.00

Ring Power Corporation $193,399.00 $193,399.00 $193,399.00 -- No bid --

JCB JS330

Glade & Grove Supply Co., Inc. $247,000.00 $246,000.00 $245,000.00 $245,000.00

John Deere 250GLC

Nortrax, Inc. $174,820.00 $174,820.00 $174,820.00 $174,820.00

Kobelco SK260LC

Cowin Equipment Company, Inc. $184,734.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $185,381.00 $185,381.00 $185,381.00

Link-Belt 250X3

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $192,024.00 $192,024.00 $192,024.00

Volvo EC250D

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $169,677.00 $169,677.00 $169,677.00 $169,677.00

#22. ALL TERRAIN WALKING EXCAVATOR

Kaiser S2

G S Equipment, Inc. $293,690.00 $293,690.00 $293,690.00 $293,690.00
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Menzi Muck A61

Menzi USA Sales, Inc. $246,062.00 $246,062.00 $246,062.00 $246,062.00

#23. VACUUM EXCAVATOR, TRAILER MOUNTED - 14,000 lb. GVWR

Pipe Hunter (Vac Hunter)

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales $75,350.00 $75,350.00 $75,350.00 $75,350.00

Vermeer LP 855DT (formerly Vactron)

Vermeer Southeast $46,072.00 $46,072.00 $46,072.00 $46,072.00

X-Vac X800

Pat's Pump and Blower, LLC $86,300.00 $86,300.00 $86,300.00 $86,300.00

#24. TELESCOPIC EXCAVATOR, TRACK TYPE - 45,000 lb. OPERATING WEIGHT

Gradall 4200 III

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $249,158.00 $249,158.00

Ring Power Corporation $250,700.00 $250,700.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#25. TELESCOPIC EXCAVATOR, WHEELED 6x6 - 47,000 lb. OPERATING WEIGHT

Gradall XL 4100 IV

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $353,899.00 $353,899.00

Ring Power Corporation $356,480.00 $356,480.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#26. 30,000 lb. COMPACTION VIBRATORY ROLLER

Bomag BW177D-40

Nortrax, Inc. $70,370.00 $70,370.00 $70,370.00 $70,370.00

Case SV208

Trekker Tractor, LLC $72,097.00 $72,097.00 $72,097.00 $72,097.00

Caterpillar CS44

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $99,688.00

Ring Power Corporation $99,141.00 $99,141.00 $99,141.00 -- No bid --

Dynapac CA250D

Trekker Tractor, LLC $107,220.00 $107,220.00 $107,220.00 $107,220.00

JCB VM75D

Glade & Grove Supply Co., Inc. $80,840.00 $80,640.00 $80,290.00 $80,290.00

Sakai SV505-I

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $96,321.79 $96,321.79 $96,321.79

Volvo SD-77D

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $81,377.00 $81,377.00 $81,377.00 $81,377.00

#27. 80,000 lb. LANDFILL COMPACTOR

Al-Jon Advantage 500

Al-jon Manufacturing LLC $750,800.00 $750,800.00 $750,800.00 $750,800.00
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Bomag BC772RB-2

Nortrax, Inc. $436,217.00 $436,217.00 $436,217.00 $436,217.00

Caterpillar 826

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $515,245.00

Ring Power Corporation $516,389.00 $516,389.00 $516,389.00 -- No bid --

#28. 4x4 LOADER BACKHOE WITH CANOPY (Standard Stick)

Case 580N

Trekker Tractor, LLC $56,988.00 $56,988.00 $56,988.00 $56,988.00

Caterpillar 416

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $63,851.00

Ring Power Corporation $64,064.00 $64,064.00 $64,064.00 -- No bid --

JCB 3CX-14

Glade & Grove Supply Co., Inc. $61,000.00 $60,800.00 $60,450.00 $60,450.00

John Deere 310K EP

Nortrax, Inc. $56,376.00 $56,376.00 $56,376.00 $56,376.00

New Holland B95C

Capital Truck, Inc. $57,165.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kingline Equipment $61,000.00 $61,000.00 $61,750.00 $62,250.00

Volvo BL60

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $56,799.00 $56,799.00 $56,799.00 $56,799.00

#29. SKID STEER LOADER - 1850 lb. OPERATING CAPACITY (Tracks or Tires)

Bobcat S185

Bobcat/Doosan Company $23,401.00 $23,401.00 $23,401.00 $23,401.00

Case SV185

Trekker Tractor, LLC $25,780.00 $25,780.00 $25,780.00 $25,780.00

Caterpillar 226

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $25,289.00

Ring Power Corporation $25,861.00 $25,861.00 $25,861.00 -- No bid --

JCB 155

Glade & Grove Supply Co., Inc. $26,395.00 $26,195.00 $25,845.00 $25,845.00

John Deere 318D

Everglades Farm Equipment Co., Inc. $22,845.00 $22,845.00 $22,845.00 $22,845.00

Nortrax, Inc. $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00

Kubota SVL75

Creel Tractor Company $39,255.00 $38,955.00 $38,855.00 $37,977.00

Futch's Tractor Depot, Inc. $35,950.00 $35,500.00 $35,500.00 $35,950.00

Triple D Equipment, Inc. $38,925.00 $38,325.00 $38,325.00 $38,625.00
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New Holland L220

Capital Truck, Inc. $27,865.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kingline Equipment $26,500.00 $26,500.00 $28,000.00 $28,500.00

Takeuchi TL230-2

Cowin Equipment Company, Inc. $39,623.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $40,060.00 $40,060.00 $40,060.00

Volvo MC95C

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $28,977.00 $28,977.00 $28,977.00 $28,977.00

#30. 3.0 CU. YD. WHEEL LOADER (Z-Bar Linkage Bucket - Parallel Arm Option)

Case 621F

Trekker Tractor, LLC $108,738.00 $108,538.00 $108,238.00 $108,238.00

Caterpillar 924

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $116,445.00

Ring Power Corporation $118,596.00 $118,596.00 $118,596.00 -- No bid --

JCB 426ZX

Glade & Grove Supply Co., Inc. $127,200.00 $126,700.00 $126,000.00 $126,000.00

John Deere 544K

Nortrax, Inc. $117,635.00 $117,635.00 $117,635.00 $117,635.00

Kawasaki 70ZV-2

Cowin Equipment Company, Inc. $147,559.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $146,440.00 $146,440.00 $146,440.00

Volvo L60G

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $118,977.00 $118,977.00 $118,977.00 $118,977.00

#31. BRUSH CHIPPER - TRAILER MOUNTED

Bandit 255XP

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $34,777.00 $34,777.00 $34,777.00 $34,777.00

DuraTech TC-12

Environmental Products of Florida $38,060.00 $38,060.00 $38,060.00 $38,060.00

Vermeer BC1500

Vermeer Southeast $39,900.00 $39,900.00 $39,900.00 $39,900.00

#32. MOTORGRADER

Case 845DHP

Trekker Tractor, LLC $169,959.00 $169,759.00 $169,559.00 $169,559.00

Caterpillar 120M

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $166,122.00

Ring Power Corporation $166,157.00 $166,157.00 $166,157.00 -- No bid --
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John Deere 670G

Nortrax, Inc. $166,524.00 $166,524.00 $166,524.00 $166,524.00

Volvo G930B

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $153,777.00 $153,777.00 $153,777.00 $153,777.00

#33. 70 HP BULLDOZER CANOPY TRACTOR (Standard Track - Wide Track Optional)

Case 650L

Trekker Tractor, LLC $68,201.00 $68,201.00 $68,201.00 $68,201.00

Caterpillar D3

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $72,538.00

Ring Power Corporation $75,317.00 $75,317.00 $75,317.00 -- No bid --

John Deere 450J

Nortrax, Inc. $66,251.00 $66,251.00 $66,251.00 $66,251.00

#34. 90 HP BULLDOZER CANOPY TRACTOR (Standard Track - Wide Track Optional)

Case 850L

Trekker Tractor, LLC $87,995.00 $87,795.00 $87,675.00 $87,675.00

Caterpillar D4

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $87,466.00

Ring Power Corporation $88,612.00 $88,612.00 $88,612.00 -- No bid --

John Deere 650K

Nortrax, Inc. $94,933.00 $94,933.00 $94,933.00 $94,933.00

#35. CUSHION TIRE LIFT TRUCK - 4,000 lb. CAPACITY

Caterpillar 2CC4000

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $27,750.00

Ring Power Corporation $27,726.00 $27,726.00 $27,726.00 -- No bid --

Nissan CFS40

Kelly Tractor Co. $21,590.00 $21,490.00 $21,290.00 $21,290.00

#36. ARTICULATED OFF ROAD DUMP TRUCK - 50,000 lb. PAYLOAD CAPACITY

Caterpillar 725

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $312,818.00

Ring Power Corporation $311,707.00 $311,707.00 $311,707.00 -- No bid --

John Deere 250D II

Nortrax, Inc. $277,243.00 $277,243.00 $277,243.00 $277,243.00

Volvo A25F

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $271,377.00 $271,377.00 $271,377.00 $271,377.00

#37. 7' x 16' ENCLOSED CARGO TRAILER – 7,000 lb. GVWR

All Pro Trailer 716TA
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General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales,
Inc.

$5,249.00 $4,999.00 $5,099.00 $5,349.00

Wells Cargo CW1622-102

Texas Trailers Sales & Service $6,808.00 $6,418.00 $6,583.00 $6,812.00

#38. 8'6" X 25' DECK OVER FLATBED TRAILER – 16,000 lb. GVWR

All Pro Trailer TA8258T

General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales,
Inc.

$9,270.00 $9,020.00 $9,120.00 $9,370.00

Eager Beaver B8-DOW

Nortrax, Inc. $12,646.00 $12,646.00 $12,646.00 $12,646.00

Econoline BPO825DE Tag Trailer

Trekker Tractor, LLC $11,900.00 $11,900.00 $11,900.00 $11,900.00

Felling Trailers FT-16-2

Federal Contracts Corp. $11,575.00 $11,575.00 $11,575.00 -- No bid --

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $11,575.00

Interstate 16BST

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $10,737.00 $10,737.00

Kingline Equipment $9,500.00 $9,700.00 $10,500.00 $11,000.00

Nortrax, Inc. $10,683.00 $10,683.00 $10,683.00 $10,683.00

Texas Trailer TX85258T

Texas Trailers Sales & Service $7,908.00 $7,317.00 $7,482.00 $7,711.00

Towmaster C-16

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $14,230.00 $14,130.00

Trail King TK18

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $14,877.00 $14,877.00 $14,877.00 $14,877.00

#39. 48' WASTE TRAILER WITH WALKING FLOOR

Mac Trailer TNSP48MF

General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales,
Inc.

$65,750.00 $65,725.00 $66,025.00 $66,175.00

#40. 14,000 lb. GVWR PULL BEHIND DUMP TRAILER

All Pro DT7147T-24

General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales,
Inc.

$7,830.00 $7,540.00 $7,640.00 $7,890.00

Big Tex 14LX

Texas Trailers Sales & Service $9,100.00 $8,790.00 $9,065.00 $9,300.00

Felling FT-12DT-HD

Federal Contracts Corp. $10,655.00 $10,655.00 $10,655.00 -- No bid --

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $10,655.00
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Towmaster T-HD12

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $12,395.00 $12,295.00

#41. SELF PROPELLED HYDROSTATIC BROOM - CENTER SLUNG

Blaw-Knox CB-90

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC $46,777.00 $46,777.00 $46,777.00 $46,777.00

Broce 350

Cowin Equipment Company, Inc. $40,243.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $38,260.00

Lee Boy Challenger V

Ring Power Corporation $63,256.00 $63,256.00 $63,256.00 $63,256.00

Sweepmaster 250

Trekker Tractor, LLC $41,711.00 $41,711.00 $41,711.00 $41,711.00

#42. 10 CUBIC YARD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANING/VACUUMING MACHINE

Aquatech B-10

Pat's Pump and Blower, LLC $152,852.00 $152,852.00 $152,852.00 $152,852.00

Super Products Camel 200

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. $189,875.00 $189,875.00 $189,875.00 $189,875.00

Vacall AJV 1010

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $148,000.00 $148,000.00 $148,000.00

Vac-Con 11 Yard

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales $146,134.00 $146,134.00 $146,134.00 $146,134.00

Vactor 2100 Plus

Environmental Products of Florida $153,061.00 $153,061.00 $153,061.00 $153,061.00

#43. REGENERATIVE AIR STREET SWEEPER

Elgin Crosswind (J Plus)

Environmental Products of Florida $195,218.00 $195,218.00 $195,218.00 $195,218.00

Johnston RT655

Pat's Pump and Blower, LLC $189,600.00 $189,600.00 $189,600.00 $189,600.00

Schwarze A7000

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. $177,977.00 $177,977.00 $177,977.00 $177,977.00

Stewart-Amos Galaxy R-8

Hall-Mark Fire Apparatus $312,721.00 $312,721.00 $312,721.00 $312,721.00

Tymco 600

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00

#44. CABOVER MECHANICAL BROOM STREET SWEEPER

Elgin Eagle
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Environmental Products of Florida $230,230.00 $230,230.00 $230,230.00 $230,230.00

Global Python 2500

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales $211,584.00 $211,584.00 $211,584.00 $211,584.00

Schwarze M6000

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. $190,000.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Stewart-Amos Starfire S-5

Hall-Mark Fire Apparatus $251,868.00 $251,868.00 $251,868.00 $251,868.00

#45. 125KW GENERATOR PACKAGE

Baldor IDLC125

ACF Standby Systems, LLC $37,780.00 $37,780.00 $37,780.00 $37,780.00

Caterpillar D125

Pantropic Power -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $37,650.00

Ring Power Corporation $37,517.00 $37,517.00 $37,517.00 -- No bid --

Tradewinds TJ125

Tradewinds Power Corp. $33,900.00 $33,900.00 $33,900.00 $33,900.00

Wacker G150

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $41,250.00 $41,250.00

Walker Miller Equipment, Inc. $68,970.00 $68,670.00 $68,670.00 $68,970.00

#46. 150KW MOBILE GENERATOR PACKAGE

Baldor TS175T

ACF Standby Systems, LLC $59,167.00 $59,167.00 $59,167.00 $59,167.00

Tradewinds TP150

Tradewinds Power Corp. $51,200.00 $51,200.00 $51,200.00 $51,200.00

Wacker G180

Kelly Tractor Co. -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $55,223.00 $55,223.00

Walker Miller Equipment, Inc. $84,210.00 $83,910.00 $83,910.00 $84,210.00

#47. 600 AMP AUTOMATIC TRANSFER SWITCH

ASCO Series 300

Ring Power Corporation $4,966.00 $4,966.00 $4,966.00 -- No bid --

Caterpillar CTG Series

Pantropic Power -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $5,225.00

Ring Power Corporation $5,205.00 $5,205.00 $5,205.00 -- No bid --

GE Zenith ZTG600

ACF Standby Systems, LLC $5,665.00 $5,665.00 $5,665.00 $5,665.00

Tradewinds TT600

Tradewinds Power Corp. $4,829.00 $4,829.00 $4,829.00 $4,829.00
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#48. 6 INCH MOBILE PUMP PACKAGE

Godwin CD150M

Godwin Pumps of America, Inc. $30,960.00 $30,960.00 $30,960.00 $30,960.00

Holland FSPT6TPC

Holland Pump $34,379.00 $34,379.00 $34,379.00 $34,379.00

NPD66 HV

National Pump & Compressor, Ltd $36,500.00 $36,500.00 $36,500.00 $36,500.00

Thompson 6JSCEN-DJDST-45T-M

Thompson Pump & Mfg. Co., Inc. $33,924.00 $33,924.00 $33,924.00 $33,924.00

Tradewinds TPK064750

Tradewinds Power Corp. $26,300.00 $26,300.00 $26,300.00 $26,300.00
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